TOWNSHIP OF MONTCLAIR

RESOLUTION REJECTING BIDS FOR THE FURNISHING OF ROAD MATERIALS

August 3, 2010

WHEREAS, on June 9, 2010, the Township of Montclair opened and read bids for the furnishing

of road materials, including paving materials, stone, sand, etc., as prescribed by law; and

WHEREAS, the Township received four bids for the required materials, all of which substantially

exceed the amount of funds appropriated for these materials; and

WHEREAS, the Local Public Contracts Law provides that a municipality may reject all bids

when the lowest bid substantially exceeds the funds appropriated for the goods or services required; now

therefore

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the Township of Montclair, in the County of Essex, that all

bids received for the furnishing of road materials be and they are hereby rejected in accordance with the

Local Public Contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-13.2.

RECORD OF COUNCIL VOTE
YES | NO | AB | N. AB YES | NO | ABS | N.V. | AB
Councilor Councilor
Councilor Deputy Mayor
Baskerville Terry
Councilor Weller-
Mayor Fried Demming
Councilor Lewis
X - Indicate Vote ~ ABS - Abstain  N.V.-Not Voting AB - Absent

I HEREBY CERTIFY the foregoing to be a true copy of a resolution adopted by the Council of
the Township of Montclair, in the County of Essex, at its meeting held on August

, 2010.

Linda S. Wanat

Clerk of the Township of Montclair, N.J.




Township of Montclair

Department of Utilities

THE FOLLOWING VENDORS SUBMITTED BIDS ON JUNE 9, 2010

FOR THE FURNISHING OF ROAD MATERIALS (PAVING MATERIALS, STONE, SAND, ETC.)

Unit prices quoted shall remain firm and in effect for one year after award of contract.

PRICES QUOTED PER VENDOR

BID ITEM WELDON WELDON LILCON NEWARK
MATERIALS QUARRY NEW YORK ASPHALT
(Weldon Asphalt) INC.
F.A.B.C. $56.00/Ton NO BID $56.60/Ton $60.00/Ton
Fine F.A.B.C. $59.00/Ton NO BID $58.60/Ton $62.00/Ton
Stabilized Base Mix $54.00/Ton NO BID $55.60/Ton $54.00/Ton
Mix 1-6 Skin Patch $69.00/Ton NO BID $64.75/Ton $76.00/Ton
3/4" Binder Mix $54.00/Ton NO BID $55.60/Ton $54.00/Ton
1/4" Mix $69.00/Ton NO BID $62.60/Ton $74.00/Ton
H.P.M. Green $130.00/Ton ** NO BID $125.00/Ton NO BID
U.P.M. Winter Mix NO BID NO BID $120.00/Ton NO BID
Bond-X (Winter Mix) $125.00/Ton ** NO BID NO BID NO BID
Winter Mix (Cold Patch) $110.00/Ton ** NO BID $115.25/Ton $110.00/Ton
3/4” Crushed Stone NO BID $15.00/Ton $15.20/Ton $22.00/Ton
3/4” Clean Stone NO BID $15.00/Ton $15.20/Ton $22.00/Ton
3/4" Quarry Processed NO BID $9.00/Ton $9.50/Ton $22.00/Ton
Quarry Processed Stone Dust NO BID $9.00/Ton $9.50/Ton $22.00/Ton
Tac-Kote $55.00/Pail *** NO BID $62.75/Pail $50.00/Pail
Washed Sand NO BID NO BID $20.20/Ton NO BID
Asphalt:
Delivery Charge $6.50/Ton $5.60/Ton N** $70.00/Hour $5.00/Ton
Stone:
$6.50/Ton

** All Hot Mix Asphalt products; delivery charge will be @ $85.00 per hour portal to portal. Delivery based on 22 ton minimum.

***Tac Kote 56 pails per pallet delivery rate of $150.00/load -- Tac-Kote is in 5 Gallon Pails.
~**$5.60/Ton Delivery Charge based on 22 ton minimum.

NAME OF VENDOR:

Newark Asphalt Corporation

PLANT LOCATION:

Foot of Passaic Street, Newark, N.J.

Weldon Materials, Inc..

PLANT LOCATION:

PLANT LOCATION:

(ASPHALT ONLY) Eisenhower Parkway, Roseland, N.J.

(ASPHALT) Rockaway, Watchung & Kearny, N.J.

(STONE) 181 Route 181, Lake Hopatcong, N.J.

Tilcon New York, Inc.

PLANT LOCATION:

(ASPHALT) 125 Hamburg Turnpike, Riverdale, N.J.

(ASPHALT) 9 Bergen Turnpike, Little Ferry, N.J.
(ASPHALT) Foot of Broad Street, Pompton Lakes, N.J.

PLANT LOCATION: (STONE QUARRY) 125 Hamburg Turnpike, Riverdale, N.J.

End of Broad Street, Pompton Lakes, N.J.

YELLOW = Lowest Bid




GREEN = Tie Bid



